HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

Endt. No. 1158 /Confdl /2017 Dated 15" September, 2017
11-3-121/92 (Pt.-3)

Copy of Letter No. A-12030/03/2017-CLS-II, dated 05.09.2017
of the Under Secretary to the Government of India, Ministry of Labour and
Employment, New Delhi, along with, enclosures, regarding vacancy to the
post of Presiding Officer in CGIT-cum-Labour Court at Mumbai-l is

being uploaded for information of all eligible candidates.

Encl: As above.

=0\
9 \S ;O\' 7
(MOHD. FAHIM ANWAR)

g/REGISTRAR GENERAL




No. A-12030/03/2017-CLS-I1
‘)/% Government of India

Ministry of Labour & Employment
kK kK %k k
Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delhi — 110001.

Dated 05.09.2017
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court/National Industrial Tribunal, Mumbai-I.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC)/National Industrial Tribunal (NIT) at Mumbai-I is to
be filled up shortly in accordance with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7B of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to
these provisions, the post can be held by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a
High Court. A serving Judge can be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term.
A retired Judge can be appointed on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of
appointment of a Judge to the post of Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The
Presiding Officers of the Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries,
Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I is
Rs.80,000/- (fixed) per month.

3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed
as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished so as to reach this Ministry within a period of one month from the date of
issue of this letter i.e. by 04.10.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. The Bio-Data of each
officer may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-III to be filled by the concerned
officer and to be attested by the concerned Registrar General.

4. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terrhs and conditions mentioned

in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with
Annexure-III.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and the
last date of sending of applications may strictly. be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations with complete profg cei

04.10.2017 will be considered by the

b Minist ,Tpg: ,magter may kindly be treated as
= TIHMSTrY,
urgent. '
@/ ARSI

DepUW 2] ol q‘hzf‘ﬂ'

Pai X M
h Cohurt & 3
ng .

i3 \‘J‘F‘M'}/

Continued on Page 2




-

-2-
6. It is further requested that this Circular may be given wide publicity including the Notice
Board of the Court so that there is sufficiently large number of candidates applying for the post.

(S. K. Sifgh) 0
Under Secretary to the Government of India
Tel. No. 011-23766903

Copy to:

1. Ministry of Law and Justice, Department of Legal Affairs, Shastri Bhawan, New Delhi
with the request that a panel of names of Judicial Officers (retired or serving) who are
willing to be appointed to the post of the Presiding Officer of the CGIT-cum-LC/NIT,
Mumbai-I may kindly be forwarded to this Ministry.

2. All Deputy Chief Labour Commissioners (Central) with the request to take up the matter
with the Registrars of the High Courts concerned for wide publicity of the circular.

Annexure-I, I, I1I. ,.09-\/\/ ;
05
(S. K. Singh)
Under Secretary to the Government of India




e oye

i
i
i
'

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2) A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Boards of Conciliation.—(1) The appropriate Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitule a Board of
Conciliation for promoling the setllement of an industrial dispute.

(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four other members, as
the appropriate Government thinks fit.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appointed in equal numbers to represent the parties to the
dispute and-any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendaltion of that parly:

Provided that, if any parly fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Government shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represent that party.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding the
absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government notifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have ceased to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as the case may be, has
been appointed.

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(7) The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notificalion in the Official Gazette constitute a Court of Inquiry for
inquiring into any malter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute.

(2) A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independent persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Court consists of two or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman.

(3) A Courl, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifics the Court that the
services of the chairman have ceased to be available, the Court shall not act until
a new chairman has been appointed.

7. Labour Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, constitute one or more Labour Courts for the adjudication -
of-industrial"disputes’ relating*to-any-matter. specified in the Second Schedule .
and forperforming such other functions as may be assigned to-them-under this *
Act-~

(2) A:Labour Court-shall-consist of one_ person only to be appointed by the ~
appropriate Government.

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4, for section 7 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 7 was amended
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951).




20 The Industrial Dispules Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

(3) A persen shall not be qualified for appointment as. the presiding officer »
of. a_Labour Court, unless—"*~ =™ 777777 T
Y{(a)"_he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Courl; or»
(b) e has, for a.period of not less than three years, been a District Judge
or.an_Additional District Judge; or

iy o St abeu ity

NT.Z.: e

3((d)]_he has held any judicial office in India for

not less than seven years;

or

3[(e)] he has been the presiding officer of a Labour Court constituted

' "undér any Provincial Act or State‘Act for not less’than five years.]

4[(f) he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner.(Central) or

Joint Commissioner of the State Labour Department, having a

degree .in-law.and-at least seven years’ experience in the labour

department including three years of experience as_Conciliation
Officer: ="

Provided thal no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or

Joint- Labour Commissioner shall be appointed- unless-he resigrs/

from-the'service-of the Central Government or State Government, as

the case may be, before being appointed as the presiding officer; or]

i(g) he is an officer of Indian Legal Service in Grade III with three years’

experience in the grade,]” 7T e e C i e s

STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and Nicobar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
lettered as clause (d)], for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Regulation 6 of 1964, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 29-4-1964).]
Goa.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:—
Y “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Court
subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time vmim in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in w\mi of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of m:m\ Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituled under any law for the time being in force for not less than five
ears; or
(d3) mm holds a decree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Comunissioner of Labour under a State Government or a
Union territory administration for not less than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act'5 of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),— :
Nc in clause (b), after the words “Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assislant Judge”; o
(i1) 1in clause Mav‘ for the words “seven years” subslitute the words “five years”;
(1ii) in clause (e), for the words “five years” subslitute the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word “or”;
after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(f) he has practised as an advocale or attorney for not less than seven years in a
‘High Court or any Court subordinate thereto or in any Industrial” Court or
“Industrial Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the time being
in force.” .

(iv

1. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

2. Clause (c) omilted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984),

3. Clauses (a) and (b) reletiered as clauses (d) and (e) respectively by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.c.f.
15-12-1964). :

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, scc. 4 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

Sec. 7] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 21

[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2.]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—
mw for clause (b), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and”
(ii) after clause (c), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Adininistrative Secretary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a H«u::
. Labour Comunissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Haryana .Act 39 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
' Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
namely:—
y “(1A) In addition to the functions specified in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
try offences punishable under this Act and the Acls specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.”
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 26-1-1982).]
In section 7, sub-section (1A), as inserled by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (quoted
above), has been omitted.
[Vide Madhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellancous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).]
Maharashtra.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely:— '
y “(d1) he has practised as an advocate or attorncy for not less than seven years in the
High Court, or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Court or Tribunal
or Labour Court, constituted under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than of Deputy Registrar
of any such Industrial Court or Tribunal for not less than fiya.years; or”.
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, scc. 2.] ’
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(d3) he holds a degree in law of a university established by law in any part of India
: and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
’ : Commissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than five
ears; or”.
[Vide ZmeBqum Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.c.f. 27-5-1976).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), after clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namely:—
:?w he is or has been a District Judge; or .
(d) he has held the office of the Chairman or any other member of the Labour Appellate
i Tribunal constituted under the Industrial HWG_ESM (Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
: or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two years.”
| [Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab Act 31 of 1966 (w.e.f. 1-11-1966).]
Ed. The above said amendinents were made prior lo :_E amendiments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
JEE,. Pradesh.—In section 7, after sub-section (3), insert the following sub-section,
namely:— .
“(3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i) of
clause.(a) of section 2.or in section 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
: Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3) shail have
effect as if— ) )
(a) after clause (c) the following new clauses (d) and (e) had been added:—
. . “(d) is or has been a Magistrate of the first class for a period exceeding two
ears;
(e) _vw a person possessing more than two. %,u.puw\ practical experience of
‘ adjudicaling or settling industrial dispptes”; : '
! (b) in the proviso after the words “clause (b)” the words “or clause (d) or clause
. (e)” had been added”. : R Co
[Vide Uttar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 (w.r.e.f. 26-6-1951).]
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made.by the
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
West Bengal.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for-‘clause (b) substitute the following
clause, namely:— o B €
“(b) he’is, or has been, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”. -
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. m (w.c.f. 22-1-1989).] :




22 The Industiial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS
Right of Labour Court
The Labour Court/Tribunal has an inherent right in the interest of justice to seck
proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ to a parly before it is represented by a legal
practiioner; T.K. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) 1V LLJ (Supp) Bom 1018.

'7A ~Tribunals.—(1) The. appropriate Government may, by notification in

the Official" Gazette, constityte - one *or 'more~Industrial..T ribunals - for - the
adjudication- of-industrial.disputes relating tg any malter, whether specified in

the - S:cond Schedule-or..the. Third Schedule *[fand for performing such other
-functions-as may be-assigned-to’ them under this ‘Act]—"*>" "

(2» A Tribunal-shall-consist- of-one- person-only-to be_appainted. by the.

appropriate Governmenl.
(3 A person shall nol be_qualified for appointment as_the presiding officer
of. a Tribunal unless—
(a).-he is, or-has been,-a-Judge of a. High Court; or™-
“l(aa) he has, for a period of not less than three-years, been a District Judge
or an Additional District-Judge; 4[***]):
*[(b)... he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or

Joint Commissioner, of_the State_Labour_ Department, having .a
degree in law and at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department . including~three~years- of- experience- as—Conciliation
Officer:

Provided .that no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or

Joint Labour. Commissioner--shall..be appointed_unless he resigns

from the service of the Central Government or State Government, -as-

the case may be, before being appdinted as the presiding officer; or]

(<) he is ‘an officer. of Indian Legal Service in-Grade-III-with -three years’
experience in-the-grade’]’ et .

(4) The appropriate -Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons

as, assessors. p.o.,maim@gmumnwg&,Eiﬁun.menmmme, vaE. ..

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the fallowing clause,
namely—
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years or is qualified for appointment as a Judge
of a High Court: .
Provided that the appointunent to a Tribunal of an person qualified under this
«clause shall not be made without consultation with the Assdm High Court; or”.
[Vile Assam’ Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] A
Bibar.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a) insert the” following clause,
namely:— . : R
“(aa) he has worked as a District Judge or as an Additional District Judge or as both for
a total period of not less than _W_.mn. years: -
Provided that the appointment to'a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultation with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or is intended to have, its usual place of sitting; or”.
[Vike Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 7-7-1959).]

Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, scc. 4 (w.c.f. 10-3-1957).

Ins. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4(a) (w.ef. 21-8-1984).

Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

The word “or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010). Easlier clause (b) was omitted by Act 46 of 1982,
sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 15-9-2010).

W=

L o

o

'

Sec. 7A] The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Goa.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitule the following clauses,
namely.--
“(b) he 1s, or has been, a Distnct Judge; or
(c) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Judge
or an Assistant Judge; or
(d) he is-qualified for appointinent as a Judge of the High Court”,
[Vide Goa Act 5 of 1987, sec. 3 (w.ef 21-10-1987).]
0....?~.E..I~: section 74, in sub-section (3),—
(i) in clause (aa), after the words “an Additional District Judge”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge”;
(i) in clause (b) [Ed. clause (b) has beeg omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the end;
(iit) after clause (b), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(¢) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force”.
[Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 3.)
In section 7A, in sub-seclion (3), after clause (c), insert, the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower m rank than that of Assistant
Conunissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”.
|Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 1-8-1981).|
Ed. The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by the Central
Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Haryana.-~In section 7A, in sub-section 3),—
(i) for clause (aa), substitute the following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
(ii) after clause (aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(aaa) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Scerctary to
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Comimissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.
[Vide Havyana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).]
Kerala.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
namely:—
“(a) he is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
qualified for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”.
Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 27-7-1961)).
Madhya Pradesh.—In section 7A, for sub-section (3), substitute the mozci_.:m sub-section,
namely.— .
“(3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
‘Tribunal unless—
(a) he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b) he is eligible for being appointed a Judge of a High Court; or
(c) he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Revenue for a period of not less
than three years; or
(¢) he has worked as Commissioner of Labour for a period of not less than three
years; or




24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7A

(f) he has worked as a member of the Industrial Cowrt constituled under
section 9 of the Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five year

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Act 19 of 1988, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 15-1-1989).]

Maharashtra.—In section 7A, in sub section (3), in clause (a), after the words “Judge of a
High Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or a person qualified for appointment as a
Judge of a High Court”.

[ Vide Maharashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).)

In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substitute the words “an Additional District Judge or an Assistant Judge or”.

After clause (b), [Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f.
21-8-1984)], insert the following clause, namely:—

“(¢) he has for not less than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Court,

constituted under any law for the ume being in force.
[Vide Maharashtra Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3]
Alter clause (¢) insert the following clause, namely:—
“(d) he holds degree in law of a CE<c_,m:.< established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of
Assistant Commussioner of Labour under the State Goverrunent for not less than ten
years.”
[Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.
Mysore (Karnataka).—(1) In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a),
following clause, namely:—
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Vide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 31-1-1963) ]
(2) In clause (aa) as inserted by Mysore Act 6 of 1963, after the words “District Judge”,
insert the words “for a period of not less than three years.”
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.ef. 12-12-1963).]
Ed. "The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
Orissa.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), after clause (a), insert the following clause,
namely:.—
“(aa) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior Judicial Service for a period of not
less than seven years.” ’
[Vide Orissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 17-3-1960).]
West Bengal.—In section 7A, in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a District Judge or an Addilional District Judge”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 22-9-1958).]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following clause, namely:-—
“(aa) he is, or has bheen, a District Judge or an Additional District Judge; or”.
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 4.]

COMMENTS

Power to constitute Industrial Court/Tribunal

Section 7A empowers the appropriate Government to constitute one or more
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any malter specified in the
Schedules. The Second Schedule enumerates the matters which fajl within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Narain Sharma v. Rajasthan Patrika Ltd., 1994
LLR 265 (Raj).

werl the

{
i
i
1

Sec. 7C]

The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 25

1[7B. National Tribunals.—(1) The Central Government may, by nolification

in the Official Gazette,

constitute one or more National Industrial Tribunals for

the mn:.ca_.nm:.o: of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Oo<m.::zc2.\ involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that 5&:&.:& establishments situated in more than one State are likely to be
inlerested in, or uﬂmﬁmm by, such disputes.

(2) A National Tribunal shall consist of one person only to be appointed b
the Central Government. Y P =y

3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer
of a Nationa!l Tribunal 2[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court].

(4) The Om_;.am_ Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint two persons as
assessors to advise the National Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

) '[7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,

sz‘c:.\:m, and National Tribunals.—No person shall be appointed to, or
continue in, the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or

National Tribunal, if—

(a) he is not an independent tm»mo:‘. or
(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

Assam.—-In section 7C,

STATE AMENDMENTS -
in clause (b), insert the following provisu, namely:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before the: completion of any
© proceedings pending before him, the State Governunent may, if in the opinion of
m:nb Government public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a

: period not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
[Vide Assam >.2m&_omw.\mnn.u?<.m.h wc:?_cmmv,_

Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the following

clause, namely:—

“(b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”.
[Vide Punjab Act 8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.ef. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 1966.]
West unsmn.ﬁ.’ra section 7C, in clause (b), insert the following Proviso, namely:—
“Pravided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Oo<m.::5m_: attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the State Government may, if in the opinion of such
Goverunent public interest so requires, order his continuance in office for a period

not exceeding six

months for completion of the proceedings.”

[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec. 3 (w.ef, 27-10-1959).}

SECTION 7D

Gujarat.—After section 7C, insert the »,o:oégm section, _.:::&vnl:

“7D. Certain District ?Aw& qualified for appointments on Tribunal constituted
by State Oocnzcz..:hluZo"E_EmE:&:m anything contained in sub-section (1) of

section 7A,—

CV The State Government may constitute an Industrial Tribunal under that sub-
section for performing such other functions as may be assigned to it under this Act
(2) Where the State Government constitutes a Tri .
Tribunal may consist of a person who s, or has been,

L. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).

" 2. 'Subs. by Act.46 of 1982,

bunal under section 7A, the
-for a period of not less than

sec. 5, for certain words (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).




The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 [Sec. 7C

5 years, a District Judge or an Additional or Joint District Judge and
notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of section 7A but subject to
section 7C, such person shall be deemed to be qualified for appointment as the
presiding officer of the Tribunal.

(3) The appointment of a person qualified under clause (2) shall be made after
consultation with the High Court.”

[Vide Gujarat Act 22 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 9-8-1962).]

![8. Filling of vacancies.—If, for any reason a vacancy (other than a
temporary absence) occurs in the office of the presiding officer of a Labour Court,
Tribunal or National Tribunal or in the office of the Chairman or any other
member of a Board or Court, then, in the case of a National Tribunal, the Cenlral
Government and in any other case, the appropriate Government, shall appoint
another person in accordance with the provisions of this Act to fill the vacancy,
and the proceeding may be continued before the Labour Court, Tribunal,
National Tribunal, Board or Court, as the case may be, from the stage at which
the vacancy is filled.] :

2[9. Finality of orders constituting Boards, etc.—(1) No order of the
appropriate Government or of the Central Government appointing any person as
the Chairman or any other member of a Board or Court or as the presiding
officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or National Tribunal shall be called in
question in any manner; and no act or proceeding before any Board or Court
shall be called in question in any manner on the ground merely of the existence
of any vacancy in, or defect in the conslitution of, such Board or Court.

(2) No settlement arrived at in the course of a conciliation proceeding shall
be invalid by reason only of the fact that such settlement was arrived at after the
expiry of the period referred to in sub-section (6) of section 12 or sub-section (5)
of section 13, as the case may be.

(3) Where the report of any settlement arrived at in the course of conciliation
proceeding before a Board is signed by the Chairman and all the other members
of the Board, no such settlement shall be invalid by reason only of the casual or
unloreseen absence of any of the members (including the Chairman) of the Board
during any stage of the proceeding.]

3[CHAPTER 1IA

NOTICE OF CHANGE

- 9A. Notice of change.—No, employer, who proposes to effect any change in
the conditions of service applicable to any workman in respect of any matter
specified in the Fourth Schedule, shall effect such change,—

(a) without giving to the workmen likely to be affected by such change
a nolice in the prescribed manner of the nature of the change
proposed to be effected; or
(b) within twenty-one days of giving such notice:’
Provided that no notice shall be required for effecting any such change—

1. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 8 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section B was substituted
by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 26-6-1951). - : '

2. Subs. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 5, for section 9 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957). Earlier section 9 was amended

by Act 40 of 1951, sec. 5 (w.e.f. 26-5-1951). :

Chapter 1IA (containing sections 9A and 9B) ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 6 (w.e.f. 10-3-1957).




Armex yve 1T
.

WSt Ho Elo TH0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

EXTRAORDINARY

T [[—WUg 3 IT-WUE ()
PART II—Seciion 3 Sub-section (i)
i | veRtivE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 275] 73 feoelt, ggw@faar, s 30, 2015/d9m@ 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

| 7 T VPR Ty
Fieg==T

¢ fe=ett, 6 39+, 2015

qr.aLR. 336(31).—F=T avER, sienfe fare sfafhaw, 1947 i g7 38 € 377 (1) F
TE () G T2 AT<RA] 1 TN F9a gu fAwterfad oy e g, satq —

1. wfem 7 8 arew.—(1) 37t w1 dfem ary aw =, senfes st s g st
(T4, W ST 517 74T F Faeee o o) fgw, 2015 21

(2) T TSI § IAF THIF F ATEE & T 219 |
2. gftwmeTe—(1) =7 Rt & 59 9% & aed § seaar a9 8r—
() “srfarfay” & srenfies Gar srf%rf?ﬂm 1947 (1947 FT 14) sfoa 2 ;

(@) “drarei sfesr & srfafags Y g 7, awr 7% a1 o 79 F sefiw feeha aftwr ¥ w
7 fager arfr afsda 2

(2) 37 areat SR WRT F, S 39 AgE §F ek & qur ot 79 @ aiq afdfem § aftfia g |
I FEt ad € o1 I AfARTT § Fer: 9% £ ‘

3. wwe.—HH fara A € frowf st F w1 F yfafagfe £ zom &, sfafgRe £ safa ‘
HTETTOAT 17 a9 £ gRY T Fariage =raefer £ zom & fFgfte G5 o it srg a% F oo gefr

1926 G1/2015 (n



"2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

A g

4. aAgT.—(1) TTE srfsor & disreA afeart &1 3497 80,000 . (FFae) wfawrg £ foa =7 71 2rm
A e sfasta Famea =raefvant Ft zom 7 wfafghe v $ dafaga =i 6 zon § a7 dom
qTgl

(2) =¥ =gTaTerd AT s sy o farfa sferT 1 aa= = g —

(i) Forerr Fmareftor (wfafe =7) - 51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(i) ForaT =manefter (w7 #oft) — 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 =,

(iii) & =mrefver (srfaFrer a99) - 70,290-1540-76,450 =.

gfd WTg % a7 § g q9F, T ARG A1 977 qartagiy F wre oSt € afR Frg

g @z T forea sfesrt % =9 & t9 =yfw £ Rgfs £ o #, i =nfas #9139 ge 1w
AT (FedT) T 7IST HYHTT F HAT A F 9% F A 2 v B Yora A1 AR grer B iy
F EIES FI ITH AT 2 AT T F TET € AT ITH Fo4 F o0 gwar 2r war 2, ferEa sfaswrt F e e
Fad a9 |7 g% G9F F a7 1 T F7 F7 =2gr qoar)
5. WIS WAT.— T srferaor wir foreia afeer deems W= 39 &7 § I #5947 Ie AT F
Fara =rgeftal # T |

(2) =¥ =TT AT SRR ATTFT F A SfeawiAl F a7 Aq HeAE A1 I FA F

THATT EHT ST FeslT HYFTY oF THg F A1l g7 ARg-a877 97 seha B o vgr & S

qAfareT 1 srafdr & v smefa suwfeast & vea Yo ¥ F9 v Ru O F oo F wewedi=
Bl

6. TR IRRE w9T.—(1) TE stfdrar % fari sttt #1 a2 7 afagws 9= 37 2R S 359
ATITAIT F FaraTefort F#13T T |
(2) =rw =g A1 @i i, F ferfm afiwmtat F 7 afaes w1 =g wE e T
Hg F e #°1 qur A st F sehw At 26
7. Tt Rama—rdt st & ferm sttt & o S0 avar e dreEr £ giegm
ITF TATAT F T U ITAE T ST AT Frs i T AT TAAT H Tl 2, T8 97 F F00F qav
(Farfrear aft=rat) faw, 1944 = swatem giaeme =@ F B g 2i )
(2) =\ =TT g7 st staeer F feria sttt F o, MfFeT gfEa 3=y e
F T ‘& srfersfvat 1 7ar anp Rt F s AfRafae gkt
8. ga.— g s ¥ drerw afgwfat F o, gt & 9 faq amwe 3g At § favd
=Tgefter T T4T AT B |
(2) =¥ =TT AT siEnfE afdEe & forfm afamtat F P, gh & @4fim s F=h
HTETT % T F AFAT F 747 AR et ¥ erefi fafatie 2

9. waM ferEr war—(1) T srfesvor F feorem srferteat F oo femar s gafsa am-giEe
a1 FTRATE qF aaq F1 arg gtaerd i g § 7o R s F1 vag G s

(2) =9 =TTy {7 senfE stfear ¥ o afawmia & oo F=0 avww F g F
FHATRAT F o7 T97 spera e R s =1 w=er fFam s |




Y[‘?PT =878 3(1)] A =h1 USTYA : STHHRT

10. Tt WA —STBrEA Sttt F1 ITF AT F qHT 97 AW G 97 AIT ZFRET F ATAT AT
ST 3 2T 2T |

1. gt arar Rama.—(1) T stfgsor & fzreim srfeemtat & oo v a9 % 3ga9 9oft o
TAT ST w9 ST For & oy gt e famara g

(2) =W =TaTE 3 st srferEwer ¥ o sftetvat % forg gt amn frarae ferfm gttt
F1 QIS F g 9T FyfRe % araq qEfartee =t 1 g97 A Rt F sefia Tt 2o
12. a1 waT.—(1) g srfewo % fewha aftmiat F o =iy awwm ge7 999 g9g o REE
#1769 F 59 F a1 9= 7 w9 G o |

(2) =% =TTy AT SRfRE stgwTor F fewia sttt @i ag Gwes v & 9 ¥ o
FIIT F IS & (o707 €T F1X 7 7 (99 a1eq 1 YA wfawrg war= &3 v g=g=7 foew g
BRI F|
13, TGO ATAT AAT—(1) I=9a8 JO F AVEET qGF1 F &0 Jq579 FIHEIT S97 T80 s
FTGFTO AT AH FATATAT FT FTIUL F94 F o0 A F oAt a5 i 99489 F q9TH 2id 97
AT F [E A7 aF T SITqTAC0T ATAT 9T 21T |

(2) =% =T 4r sientrE sfgwr F feeiw sattwiat F o eraEer e =
qATASE F sreR ) ARE F amea @i st F B d = avwr F g ey et F
AT ZAT
14. st alw-Rfy v —forim sttt @1 afeeh st =i 5 {5 s
qAfAare it srafer F e A F#1 gF g0 |
15. = QAT 4. —37 WHSA $1 araq ST are § F2 A= Iqay Tg1 a97 T F Aeqe AT
agEat fit 74T F FHagHl & aat § gatga gyt £ g g F B F o e s, st
arfsrvor a1 gt i grer ARt g STu, s Fd avea e w5 39 v Rt aremsEr e

16. fafee v it afs.—=07 gv=17 1 2= Ryt F & 3ody 1 BT =351 ar gt F =t £ g
forfaer e o orfxr ERMT

[/. Se-25025/05/2013-+UATH-2]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E).—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (c) of sub-section(l) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act. 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service)
Rules. 2015.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Definitions.—(1) In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,-

(a) “*Act” mcans the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947),



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(b) “Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(2) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respectively assigned to them in the Act.

3. Duration.—In casc of appointment on deputation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period

of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges. the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 80,000/- (fixcd)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2)  The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be-
(i) the District Judge (Entry Level) — Rs.51,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070
(i1) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs. 57.700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210
(ii1) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-1540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension. pension equivalent or other retirement benefits. if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer. who has retired from Judicial
Scrvice or as Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the Statc Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers of National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissible to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitled to deamness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A™ Officers of the Central Government drawing an cquivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment.

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding officers of National Tribunals. the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courts.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the city compensatory allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group —"A”" Officers of the Central Government.

7. Medical Concession.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal. the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the station of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operation, they shall be entittled to the facilities as provided in the Central Services (Medical Attendance) Rules, 1944.

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilitics shall bc rcgulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-* A” Officers of the Central Government.

8. Leave.—(1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal. the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissiblc to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government.

9.  House Rent Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furnished accommodation or, as the case may be, the housc rent allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

(2)  For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal. there shall be provided the House
Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-“A™ Officers of the Central Government.

10.  Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
entitlement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.




v

’

[T 11-@vg 3(i)] YR R TS : 3THIHN 5

11. Leave Travel Concession.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal. the Leave Travel Concession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal. there shall be provided
the conveyance allowance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from time to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seventy five litres of petrol per
month.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance.—(1) The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible to a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal or
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignment.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling allowance
shall be as per Central Government rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-employed basis.

14.  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

15.  Other Conditions of Service.—Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been made in these rules, shall be referred by the
Labour Court. Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal to the Central Government for its decision. and the decision of the
Central Government thercon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to rclax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-II]
DHEERAJ KUMAR. Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager. Government of India Press. Ring Road. Mayapuri. New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications. Delhi-110054.




Proforma for Bio-data

(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Annexure-III1

1. | Name (in full)

2. | Date of Birth

3. | Educational Qualification

4. | Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
High Court Judge

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

5. | Details
in
respect
of last/
current
post
held

Name of the last/current post

Date of appointment to
last/current post

Date of retirement

Scale of pay

Last pay drawn

6. | Address for communication

7. | Phone no.

(Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

8. | E-mail address

Date:

Place:

Signature:

Name:



	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014

